Excerpt from:
The Small Business Jobs Act of 2010, Pub. L. 111-240

SEC. 2102. INCREASE IN INFORMATION RETURN PENALTIES.

(a) Failure To File Correct Information Returns-
(1) IN GENERAL- Subsections (a)(1), (b)(1)(A), and (b)(2)(A) of section 6721 of
the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 are each amended by striking "$50' and
inserting “$100".
(2) AGGREGATE ANNUAL LIMITATION- Subsections (a)(1), (d)(1)(A), and
(€)(3)(A) of section 6721 of such Code are each amended by striking “$250,000'
and inserting “$1,500,000'.
(b) Reduction Where Correction Within 30 Days-
(1) IN GENERAL- Subparagraph (A) of section 6721(b)(1) of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking "$15' and inserting “$30'.
(2) AGGREGATE ANNUAL LIMITATION- Subsections (b)(1)(B) and
(d)(1)(B) of section 6721 of such Code are each amended by striking “$75,000'
and inserting “$250,000".
(c) Reduction Where Correction on or Before August 1-
(1) IN GENERAL- Subparagraph (A) of section 6721(b)(2) of the Internal
Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “$30" and inserting “$60".
(2) AGGREGATE ANNUAL LIMITATION- Subsections (b)(2)(B) and
(d)(2)(C) of section 6721 of such Code are each amended by striking “$150,000'
and inserting "$500,000'.
(d) Aggregate Annual Limitations for Persons With Gross Receipts of Not More Than
$5,000,000-
(1) IN GENERAL- Paragraph (1) of section 6721(d) of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986 is amended--
(A) by striking "$100,000' in subparagraph (A) and inserting “$500,000",
(B) by striking "$25,000" in subparagraph (B) and inserting "$75,000', and
(C) by striking "$50,000' in subparagraph (C) and inserting “$200,000'.
(2) TECHNICAL AMENDMENT- Paragraph (1) of section 6721(d) of such Code
is amended by striking “such taxable year' and inserting “such calendar year'.
(e) Penalty in Case of Intentional Disregard- Paragraph (2) of section 6721(e) of the
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “$100' and inserting “$250'".
() Adjustment for Inflation- Section 6721 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is
amended by adding at the end the following new subsection:
“(f) Adjustment for Inflation-
(1) IN GENERAL- For each fifth calendar year beginning after 2012, each of the
dollar amounts under subsections (a), (b), (d) (other than paragraph (2)(A)
thereof), and (e) shall be increased by such dollar amount multiplied by the cost-
of-living adjustment determined under section 1(f)(3) determined by substituting
“calendar year 2011' for "calendar year 1992' in subparagraph (B) thereof.
"(2) ROUNDING- If any amount adjusted under paragraph (1)--
“(A) is not less than $75,000 and is not a multiple of $500, such amount
shall be rounded to the next lowest multiple of $500, and



“(B) is not described in subparagraph (A) and is not a multiple of $10,
such amount shall be rounded to the next lowest multiple of $10.".
(9) Failure To Furnish Correct Payee Statements- Section 6722 of the Internal Revenue
Code of 1986 is amended to read as follows:

"SEC. 6722. FAILURE TO FURNISH CORRECT PAYEE STATEMENTS.

“(a) Imposition of Penalty-
(1) GENERAL RULE- In the case of each failure described in paragraph (2) by
any person with respect to a payee statement, such person shall pay a penalty of
$100 for each statement with respect to which such a failure occurs, but the total
amount imposed on such person for all such failures during any calendar year
shall not exceed $1,500,000.
"(2) FAILURES SUBJECT TO PENALTY- For purposes of paragraph (1), the
failures described in this paragraph are--
“(A) any failure to furnish a payee statement on or before the date
prescribed therefor to the person to whom such statement is required to be
furnished, and
“(B) any failure to include all of the information required to be shown on a
payee statement or the inclusion of incorrect information.
“(b) Reduction Where Correction in Specified Period-
(1) CORRECTION WITHIN 30 DAYS- If any failure described in subsection
(@)(2) is corrected on or before the day 30 days after the required filing date--
“(A) the penalty imposed by subsection (a) shall be $30 in lieu of $100,
and
"(B) the total amount imposed on the person for all such failures during
any calendar year which are so corrected shall not exceed $250,000.
"(2) FAILURES CORRECTED ON OR BEFORE AUGUST 1- If any failure
described in subsection (a)(2) is corrected after the 30th day referred to in
paragraph (1) but on or before August 1 of the calendar year in which the required
filing date occurs--
“(A) the penalty imposed by subsection (a) shall be $60 in lieu of $100,
and
“(B) the total amount imposed on the person for all such failures during
the calendar year which are so corrected shall not exceed $500,000.
“(c) Exception for De Minimis Failures-
(1) IN GENERAL- If--
“(A) a payee statement is furnished to the person to whom such statement
is required to be furnished,
"(B) there is a failure described in subsection (a)(2)(B) (determined after
the application of section 6724(a)) with respect to such statement, and
“(C) such failure is corrected on or before August 1 of the calendar year in
which the required filing date occurs,
for purposes of this section, such statement shall be treated as having been
furnished with all of the correct required information.



"(2) LIMITATION- The number of payee statements to which paragraph (1)
applies for any calendar year shall not exceed the greater of--
“(A) 10, or
"(B) one-half of 1 percent of the total number of payee statements required
to be filed by the person during the calendar year.

*(d) Lower Limitations for Persons With Gross Receipts of Not More Than $5,000,000-
(1) IN GENERAL- If any person meets the gross receipts test of paragraph (2)
with respect to any calendar year, with respect to failures during such calendar
year--

“(A) subsection (a)(1) shall be applied by substituting “$500,000' for
"$1,500,000',
*(B) subsection (b)(1)(B) shall be applied by substituting “$75,000' for
"$250,000', and
*(C) subsection (b)(2)(B) shall be applied by substituting “$200,000' for
"$500,000.
"(2) GROSS RECEIPTS TEST- A person meets the gross receipts test of this
paragraph if such person meets the gross receipts test of section 6721(d)(2).

“(e) Penalty in Case of Intentional Disregard- If 1 or more failures to which subsection (a)

applies are due to intentional disregard of the requirement to furnish a payee statement

(or the correct information reporting requirement), then, with respect to each such failure-
*(1) subsections (b), (c), and (d) shall not apply,

*(2) the penalty imposed under subsection (a)(1) shall be $250, or, if greater--
“(A) in the case of a payee statement other than a statement required under
section 6045(b), 6041A(e) (in respect of a return required under section
6041A(b)), 6050H(d), 6050J(e), 6050K(b), or 6050L(c), 10 percent of the
aggregate amount of the items required to be reported correctly, or
“(B) in the case of a payee statement required under section 6045(b),
6050K (b), or 6050L(c), 5 percent of the aggregate amount of the items
required to be reported correctly, and

*(3) in the case of any penalty determined under paragraph (2)--

“(A) the $1,500,000 limitation under subsection (a) shall not apply, and
*(B) such penalty shall not be taken into account in applying such
limitation to penalties not determined under paragraph (2).

“(f) Adjustment for Inflation-

(1) IN GENERAL- For each fifth calendar year beginning after 2012, each of the
dollar amounts under subsections (a), (b), (d)(1), and (e) shall be increased by
such dollar amount multiplied by the cost-of-living adjustment determined under
section 1(f)(3) determined by substituting “calendar year 2011' for "calendar year
1992' in subparagraph (B) thereof.

"(2) ROUNDING- If any amount adjusted under paragraph (1)--

“(A) is not less than $75,000 and is not a multiple of $500, such amount
shall be rounded to the next lowest multiple of $500, and

*(B) is not described in subparagraph (A) and is not a multiple of $10,
such amount shall be rounded to the next lowest multiple of $10.".



(h) Effective Date- The amendments made by this section shall apply with respect to
information returns required to be filed on or after January 1, 2011.



